
 

 

February 24, 2016 

 

Mr. Robert Burkey, Director of Facilities 

School District of Independence 

201 North Forest Avenue 

Independence, Missouri   64050 

V. 816 521.5330    F. 816 521.5627 

robert_burkey@isdschools.org 
 

 

RE: INDEPENDENCE SCHOOL DISTRICT 2016 ASPHALT IMPROVEMENTS 

 Independence, Missouri 

 

Bids were received at 2:00 p.m., local time, on February 23, 2016, on the above referenced 

project.  A total of six (6) Contractors submitted bids.  We provide a copy of the Bid Tabulation 

sheet for your reference. 

At this time, we would recommend accepting the Glendale Elementary School Combination Bid, 

Hanthorn Early Education Combination Bid and Alternate #1, and Three Trails Elementary 

Combination Bid for 2016 Asphalt Improvements and these projects be awarded to Phillips Paving 

Co. Inc.   

 

Should you have any questions or need additional information, please feel free to call our office. 

HOLLIS + MILLER ARCITECTS 

 

Justin Durham, NCARB, AIA 

Project Architect 

16004 - 2 

mailto:robert_burkey@isdschools.org


BID TABULATION                                                            BID TABULATION                                                            BID TABULATION                                                            BID TABULATION                                                            

Project: ISD 2016 Asphalt Improvements  -  GLENDALE ELEMNTARY SCHOOLISD 2016 Asphalt Improvements  -  GLENDALE ELEMNTARY SCHOOLISD 2016 Asphalt Improvements  -  GLENDALE ELEMNTARY SCHOOLISD 2016 Asphalt Improvements  -  GLENDALE ELEMNTARY SCHOOL

Owner: INDEPENDENCE SCHOOL DISTRICT  INDEPENDENCE SCHOOL DISTRICT  INDEPENDENCE SCHOOL DISTRICT  INDEPENDENCE SCHOOL DISTRICT  201 N. Forest Avenue, Independence, MO  64050

Architect: HOLLIS+HOLLIS+HOLLIS+HOLLIS+MILLER MILLER MILLER MILLER ARCHITECTS            ARCHITECTS            ARCHITECTS            ARCHITECTS            220 NW Executive Way Lee’s Summit, MO 64063  525.5600

Contractor: ADD #1-2 SoGCQ Bid Bond Base Bid 01A - North Lot Base Bid 01B - North Drive Base Bid 01C - Drop Off LoopBase Bid 01D - West Drive Base Bid 01E - South DriveBase Bid 01 - Voluntary Combo Unit Price 1 | 2 |  3

F. D. R. $69.00

WIL-PAV INC X X $34,641.00 $4,165.00 $1,495.00 $4,497.00 $16,960.00 NO BID Wheel Stop $100.00

Profile Mill $5.00

F. D. R. $38.00

ADVANCED ASPHALT X X $35,400.00 $6,430.00 $2,888.00 $6,480.00 $23,236.00 $69,734.00 Wheel Stop $75.00

Profile Mill $4.50

F. D. R. $40.00

BARKLEY ASPHALT X X $34,739.00 $7,249.00 $4,407.00 $7,680.00 $25,583.00 $77,000.00 Wheel Stop $75.00

Profile Mill $5.00

F. D. R. $80.00

TANDEM PAVING X X $32,998.00 $2,945.00 $1,097.00 $4,670.00 $19,448.00 $61,157.00 Wheel Stop $85.00

Profile Mill $5.00

F. D. R. $7.50

PHILLIPS PAVINGPHILLIPS PAVINGPHILLIPS PAVINGPHILLIPS PAVING X X X $28,989.00 $3,100.00 $2,122.00 $5,260.00 $18,440.00 $48,103.00$48,103.00$48,103.00$48,103.00 Wheel Stop $70.00

Profile Mill $2.25

F. D. R. $69.27

BLACKTOP PAVING AND MAINT X X $48,456.00 $9,627.00 $5,110.00 $8,747.00 $32,010.00 $103,950.00 Wheel Stop $90.00

Profile Mill $4.00

Bid Date 23 February 2016   2:00 p.m. local time



BID TABULATION                                                            BID TABULATION                                                            BID TABULATION                                                            BID TABULATION                                                            

Project: ISD 2016 Asphalt Improvements  -  HANTHORN ELEMNTARY SCHOOLISD 2016 Asphalt Improvements  -  HANTHORN ELEMNTARY SCHOOLISD 2016 Asphalt Improvements  -  HANTHORN ELEMNTARY SCHOOLISD 2016 Asphalt Improvements  -  HANTHORN ELEMNTARY SCHOOL

Owner: INDEPENDENCE SCHOOL DISTRICT  INDEPENDENCE SCHOOL DISTRICT  INDEPENDENCE SCHOOL DISTRICT  INDEPENDENCE SCHOOL DISTRICT  201 N. Forest Avenue, Independence, MO  64050

Architect: HOLLIS+HOLLIS+HOLLIS+HOLLIS+MILLER MILLER MILLER MILLER ARCHITECTS            ARCHITECTS            ARCHITECTS            ARCHITECTS            220 NW Executive Way Lee’s Summit, MO 64063  525.5600

Contractor: ADD #1-2 SoGCQ Bid Bond Base Bid 02A - North Drive Base Bid 02B - East Parking Lot Base Bid 02C - Playground Base Bid 02 - Voluntary Combo Unit Price 1 | 2 |  3 Alternate #1

F. D. R. $69.00

WIL-PAV INC X X $11,911.00 $35,474.00 $2,601.00 NO BID Wheel Stop $100.00 $15,975.00

Profile Mill $5.00

F. D. R. $38.00

ADVANCED ASPHALT X X $12,680.00 $39,848.00 $3,881.00 $53,295.00 Wheel Stop $75.00 $124,000.00

Profile Mill $4.50

F. D. R. $40.00

BARKLEY ASPHALT X X $9,586.00 $32,480.00 $3,700.00 $44,837.00 Wheel Stop $75.00 $94,525.00

Profile Mill $5.00

F. D. R. $80.00

TANDEM PAVING X X $15,178.00 $46,202.00 $3,772.00 $58,739.00 Wheel Stop $85.00 NO BID

Profile Mill $5.00 7.5

F. D. R. $7.50

PHILLIPS PAVINGPHILLIPS PAVINGPHILLIPS PAVINGPHILLIPS PAVING X X X $11,254.00 $22,528.00 $3,412.00 $24,911.00$24,911.00$24,911.00$24,911.00 Wheel Stop $70.00 $11,713.00$11,713.00$11,713.00$11,713.00

Profile Mill $2.25

F. D. R. $69.27

BLACKTOP PAVING AND MAINT X X $18,307.00 $46,111.00 $4,467.00 $68,885.00 Wheel Stop $90.00 $450,000.00

Profile Mill $4.00

Bid Date 23 February 2016   2:00 p.m. local time



BID TABULATION                                                            BID TABULATION                                                            BID TABULATION                                                            BID TABULATION                                                            

Project: ISD 2016 Asphalt Improvements  -  THREE TRAILS ELEMNTARY SCHOOLISD 2016 Asphalt Improvements  -  THREE TRAILS ELEMNTARY SCHOOLISD 2016 Asphalt Improvements  -  THREE TRAILS ELEMNTARY SCHOOLISD 2016 Asphalt Improvements  -  THREE TRAILS ELEMNTARY SCHOOL

Owner: INDEPENDENCE SCHOOL DISTRICT  INDEPENDENCE SCHOOL DISTRICT  INDEPENDENCE SCHOOL DISTRICT  INDEPENDENCE SCHOOL DISTRICT  201 N. Forest Avenue, Independence, MO  64050

Architect: HOLLIS+HOLLIS+HOLLIS+HOLLIS+MILLER MILLER MILLER MILLER ARCHITECTS            ARCHITECTS            ARCHITECTS            ARCHITECTS            220 NW Executive Way Lee’s Summit, MO 64063  525.5600

Contractor: ADD #1-2 SoGCQ Bid Bond Base Bid 03A - East Lot Base Bid 03B - West Lot Base Bid 03C - Southeast LotBase Bid 03D - Drop Off LoopBase Bid 03 - Voluntary Combo Unit Price 1 | 2 |  3

F. D. R.  $69.00

WIL-PAV INC X X $1,327.00 $1,386.00 $23,525.00 $2,250.00 NO BID Wheel Stop $100.00

Profile Mill $5.00

F. D. R. $38.00

ADVANCED ASPHALT X X $1,838.00 $1,944.00 $22,842.00 $4,355.00 $29,122.00 Wheel Stop $75.00

Profile Mill $4.50

F. D. R. $40.00

BARKLEY ASPHALT X X $2,382.00 $2,763.00 $21,455.00 $5,498.00 $29,980.00 Wheel Stop $75.00

Profile Mill $5.00

F. D. R. $100.00

TANDEM PAVING X X $1,283.00 $1,362.00 $20,388.00 $2,660.00 $25,692.00 Wheel Stop $85.00

Profile Mill $5.00

F. D. R. $7.50

PHILLIPS PAVINGPHILLIPS PAVINGPHILLIPS PAVINGPHILLIPS PAVING XXXX XXXX XXXX $1,750.00 $1,800.00 $18,897.00 $3,546.00 $23,197.00$23,197.00$23,197.00$23,197.00 Wheel Stop $70.00

Profile Mill $2.25

F. D. R. $69.27

BLACKTOP PAVING AND MAINT X X $2,157.00 $2,463.00 $21,840.00 $3,217.00 $29,677.00 Wheel Stop $90.00

Profile Mill $4.00

Bid Date 23 February 2016   2:00 p.m. local time
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